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students. The idea was to
encourage ‘gossiping’ students to
come together and give a bid on
subjects, projects and tasks so

they can together come up with a
solution that best suits the

institution’s needs. Continue
reading → Things to do during a
power blackout, compiled by IIT
Bombay’s Facebook Group for

students. Last year we invited our
friends from University of Sydney,
Australia and had a night of fun.
This year, we are inviting people
living and studying in Singapore.

If you are a student at IIT
Bombay, you are more than
welcome to join us! Continue

reading → Last year I was invited
to Australia to give lectures at

UNSW and at Queensland
University. I had the opportunity
to meet and discuss the concept

of the Living City with two people,
two people who work in this

space, the first being Michael
Tyrrell – A Senior Consultant with
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the City of Sydney, and Dr Ravi
Gangadharan – Director of the

NSW Smart City Laboratory, both
of them with extensive

experience in Smart City
programs. Continue reading →

Last year I was invited to
Singapore to give a talk at the
Hackerspace Singapore (HSi)

Workshop. I was also given the
task to brainstorm concepts and
write a short description of an

idea to motivate the members of
the HSi Hackerspace to work

together on this idea.Continue
reading → Last year I was invited
to Singapore to give a talk at the

Hackerspace Singapore (HSi)
Workshop. I was also given the

task to brainstorm concepts and
write a short description of an

idea to motivate the members of
the HSi Hackerspace to work

together on this idea.Continue
reading → Our team came to

Singapore recently to attend and
give talks at the Singapore
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